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v Selengkapnya Dear Authors,
(@] Greetings from [JELS Editorial Office!
Meet We received your manuscript which was previewed for its relevance, originality, and quality. The manuscript is within the scope of IJELS and has an
Label + engaging topic and with only 8% of similarity index, it is an original work. However, there is still room for improvement. Please follow the comments in the file

attached, revise and resubmit.

Please also note that IJELS has a processing fee of $210AUD. You may transfer through our PayPal account (Our PayPal ID: PayPal@aiac.org.au)_or you
could follow the instructions here:

https://aiac.org.aulindex.php?option=com _content&view=article&id=172&Itemid=633 to pay the processing fee. Your manuscript will be sent for review after
you send us your proof of payment. This fee will be refunded if it is rejected.

Please acknowledge the receipt of this email and in your future correspondence and kindly mention the aforementioned manuscript ID or preferably reply to
this email.

Thank you for your interest in publishing with JJELS indexed in ERIC and DOAJ, among others.

Best regards,

Vahid Nimehchisalem, PhD

Editor-in-Chief

Intemational Journal of Education and Literacy, Studies
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m} ¥ Berbintang On Tue, May 14, 2019 at 12:18 PM IJELS Editorial Office <editor.ijels@aiac.org.au> wrote:
Chat ® Ditunda Subject: Fostering Students’ High Order Thinking Skills through the Use of Interpretation Cards |
293 B> Terkirim Submission Acknowledgement (Manuscript ID: IJELS_7319)

Spaces O Draf

v Selengkapnya Dear Author(s),

) Your submission was well-received and will shortly be previewed for its relevance, quality, and originality.
In your future correspondence, please

b=t Label + 1. Copy to all your co-authors;

2. Mention your aforementioned manuscript ID or preferably reply to this email; and
3. Complete the Cover Letter and Declaration Form on ‘AUTHOR GUIDE AND SUBMISSIONS’ menu in our
website and return it to us.

We will get back to you with your preview results within the next 48 hours. Thank you for your interest in publishing
with [JELS.

Best regards,
Vahid Nimehchisalem, PhD
Editor-in-Chief

International Journal of Education and Literacy Studies
[EDUCATING FOR THE FUTURE
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D oraf ank you for your email.
SIS We have received both your review reports which will be sent to you shortly.
Vv Selengkapnya Best regards,
[a] Vahid Nimehchisalem, PhD
Editor-in-Chief
Meet Label + International Journal of Education and Literacy, Studies
EDUCATING FOR THE FUTURE
Slamet Asari <asari70@umg.ac.id> 27 Agu 2019 09.45 ﬁ “« :
kepada IJELS

Okay thank you very much for the updated info and we are now expecting the result of the review. Hopefully it will not be considered as major
revision and will sooner be published. B

Best regards
Slamet Asari <
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v Selengkapnya Dear Author,
(@] I'm writing to confirm that we have received your amended manuscript which will be further evaluated and if acceptable will be processed for review.
Meet Label + Kindly send us your proof of payment once you have transferred the fee. Thank you very much for your contribution.
Warm regards,
Vahid

On Tue, May 21, 2019, 11:18 Slamet Asari <asari70@umg.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Editor,
Thank you very much for the review regarding my article (Manuscript ID: IJELS_7319). we have made some revisions based on the comments.
we also will complete a processing fee as informed and will tell you when it is accomplished. Thank you very much.

Best regards
Slamet Asari <





